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Acrónimo: - 

Designação do projeto (PT/EN): ACE2-EU - European University 

Código do projeto: 101177596 

Objetivo principal:  

Entidade financiadora/Programa de 

financiamento: 

EACEA - European Education and Culture Executive 
Agency 

Região de intervenção: - 

Investimento Total Elegível: 14.397.683,00 € 

Custo total elegível (IPSantarém): 1.742.297,00 € 

Apoio financeiro da União Europeia: 1.306.723,00 € 

Apoio financeiro público nacional/regional:  435.574,00 € 

Taxas de financiamento: 80,00 % 

Entidade beneficiária: Instituto Politécnico de Santarém 

Investigador Responsável: Maria Costa Potes Franco B. Santa Clara Barbas 

Parceiros: 

 Carinthia University of Applied Sciences, (Áustria); 
 Universitatea Constantin Brâncuși Târgu-Jiu, (Roménia); 
 Goce Delcev University, (North Macedonia); 
 Universidad Francisco de Vitoria UFV, (Spain); 
 Medical University of Gdańsk, (Poland); 
 Kauno Techikos Kolegija, (Lithuania); 
 Latvian Academy of Culture, (Latvia); 
 Technische Hochschule Ingolstadt, (Germany). 

Equipa: 

Cristina Maria Junceiro Novo; 

Luís Cláudio dos Santos Barradas; 

Maria Paula Sousa Ferreira Silva Martinho Pinto; 

Susana Carla Alves Franco. 

Data da aprovação:  - 

Data de início: 2024/01/01 

Data da conclusão: 2028/10/31 

Domínio científico e subárea científica:  - 

Resumo (objetivos, atividades e resultados 

esperados) - em PT e/ou EN: 

The mission of ACE2-EU is to provide our students, 
staff, researchers, and external stakeholders; through 
the establishment of our Inter-University European 
University Campus; with the knowledge, skills, and 
competencies to collectively address future challenges; 
including the twin digital and green transitions and 
current socio-economic issues; thereby delivering 
sustainable societal transformation today for the benefit 
of all our stakeholders and society overall both within our 
alliance and across the EU. 
 
To achieve this mission the members of ACE2-EU will 
take an Applied, Connected, Entrepreneurial and 
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Engaged approach with stakeholders in the creation of 
joint initiatives and activities. The members of the 
alliance will mobilise all mission areas of their 
universities and will jointly develop and deliver 
education, research, innovation, and service to society 
learning opportunities and activities in partnership with 
external stakeholders from business, industry, regional 
government, and society.  Our joint learning 
opportunities and activities will focus on addressing 
future challenges, including the twin digital and green 
transitions and current socio-economic issues. 
 
ACE2-EU will deliver on its mission by applying, active, 
challenge & real world, work-based learning, and 
entrepreneurial approaches in the development of its 
joint education, research, innovation, and service to 
society activities through collaboration with external 
stakeholders. By applying an active learning approach at 
the core of our joint activities’ students will automatically 
be involved in the co-creation of knowledge thereby 
improving their professional and personal development 
capacity. 
 
The learning opportunities and activities to be created 
will be flexible and innovative in nature, will use the most 
up to date pedagogical approaches; and take advantage 
of the most modern processes, policies, theories, and 
technologies available in the working world. The 
activities and learning opportunities will be created by 
multi-disciplinary knowledge-creating teams using a 
challenge-based approach made up of students, 
academic staff, researchers, and external stakeholders. 
 
This mission to be delivered by our European University 
will have at its core a common vision and shared values, 
an inclusive student-centred joint governance and 
management structure, a shared pool of resources; 
including shared staff and joint operational units and 
support systems; and will ultimately seek to achieve 
legal status. 
In implementing its mission ACE2-EU will foster at its 
core existing European Union principles, values and 
objectives including multiculturalism and multilingualism 
thereby strengthening European identity across our 
European University. 
 
The diagram below provides a visual representation 
ACE2-EU including its joint shared operational units and 
their associated learning opportunities and initiatives 
designed to mobilise the collective strengths of ACE2-
EU members in the four University mission areas of 
education, research, innovation, and service to society. 
The initiatives to be delivered by the alliance will not only 
address future challenges and deliver on sustainable 
societal transformation, but will also promote mobility 
opportunities, multiculturalism, multilingualism, EU 
values and EU identity across our European University.        

Link para página do projeto (outros Links):  https://ace-eu.ipsantarem.pt/  

Outras informações:  
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